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RESOLUTION

A RESOLUTION CHANGING THE NAME OF A STREET
IN SEDGWICK COUNTY, KANSAS, AND REPEALING

ALL ORDINANCES AND/OR RESOLUTIONS OR PARTS
THEREOF IN CONFLICT HEREWITH.

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COM-
MISSIONERS OF SEDGWICK COUNTY, KANSAS:

SECTION I. That after hearing the recommendation of
the Wichita-Sedgwick County Metropolitan Area Planning Commission,
the name of Edna Lane should be, and the same is hereby changed
from and after the effective date of this Resolution, and shall

be known, named, and designated by the respective new name as
follows, to-wit:

Edna Street, as platted in Evermoor
Addition, be changed to Edna Lane.

SECTION II. That all other names previously assigned,
either officially or otherwise to this street, are hereby made
null and void.

SECTION III. This Resolution shall take effect and be
in force from and after its adoption and publication.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of County Commissioners
of Sedgwick County, at Wichita, Kansas this day of
, 1977.

Tom Scott, Chairman

John Hale, Commissioner
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Everett Patrick, Commissioner

ATTEST:

Dorothy K. White, County Clerk

(SEAL)

Approved as to form by:

ey 7 Z

Theodore H. Hill, County Counselor




BOARD OF SEDGWICK COUNTY CCMMISSIONERS
PROCEEDINGS

MEETING OF THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
'REGULAR MEETING
OCTOBER 26, 1977
AGENDA

Invocation by the Christian Businessmen's Committee
Roll call

Approval of Minutes of Special Meeting, October 14, 1977
Regular Meeting, October 19, 1977

Certification as to Availability of Funds - County
Controller

Metropolitan Area Planning Department:

1. DR 77-24 - Street Name Change from Edna Street
to Edna Lane

ACTION: 1. Approve the change and adopt a resolution
effectuating the change; or
2. Deny the name change.

Approval of Mental Health Lease

Renewal of a one-year lease for the property located at
1354 Fairview, the present site of Day Treatment Program
Center at an annual rental of $2,400.

ACTION: 1. Approve the lease; or
2. Deny the lease

Resolution Transferring Overages from the Offices of
Ronald G, Miller and Marie Warden to the General Fund
of Sedgwick County.

A resolution transferring $5,993.14 in overages from
the Ronald Miller Account, during his term of office
as County Treasurer, and $250.00 in overages from the
Marie Warden Account, during her term of office as
County Clerk, to the general fund.

ACTION: 1. Adopt the resolution; or
2. Deny the resolution.

Memorandum of Understanding - Kansas Forestry Fish §
Game Commission - Gordon L. Schneider and Tom Yount

" An agreement with the Game Commission to sample the
fish population and formulate a fish management plan
. for Sedgwick County Zoo Park.

.. ACTION: 1. Approve the Memorandum of Understanding;
- or
2. Deny the Memorandum




BOARD OF SEDGWICK COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
PROCEEDINGS

Agenda-Page 2
October 26, 1977

I. Department of Public Works:
1. Right-of-Way Matters:

a. Southwestern Bell Telephone Company requests
permission to bury a communications line
across 31st Street South, approximately 150
feet east of 407th Street West. They will
cut across sanded road at a minimum depth of
30 inches to the ditch line, thence east 81
feet at a minimum depth of 30 inches, thence
north to new residence. No blacktop roadways
cut; no cost to Sedgwick County.

Southwestern Bell Telephone Company requests
permission to bury a communications cable
starting at 119th Street South and proceeding
north approximately 2,346 feet on the west
side of 127th Street East. The cable will be
buried a minimum depth of 24 inches approxi-
mately 8 feet from right-of-way. No blacktop
Cut; no cost to Sedgwick County.

ACTION: Take such action as the Board of County
Commissioners deem to be in the best
interest of the general public.

2. Resolutions:

~a. Resolution to place a four-way stop at the
intersection of County Road #636 and #7907
(71st Street South and 183rd Street West).

ACTION: Take such action as the Board of County
Commissioners deem to be in the best
interest of the general public.

b. Resolution Approving Final Plans and Specifi-
cations for Arbor Lakes Sewers, Phase T

ACTION: Take such action as the Board of County
Commissioners deem to be in the best
interest of the general public.

Resolution Approving Final Plans and Specifi-
cations for Courtroom on 10th Floor of County
Courthouse.

ACTION: Take such action as the Board of County
Commissioners deem to be in the best
interest of the general public.

3. Change Orders:
Ea e Change Order on the courtroom addition on
the fifth floor of County Courthouse;
Contractor - Pyramid Construction; amount
- an increase of $2,867.00.

- ACTION: Take such action as the Board of County
: Commissioners deem to be in the best
interest of the general public.




BOARD OF SEDGWICK COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
PROCEEDINGS

Agenda-Page 3
October 26, 1977

4. Contracts:

a. Execution of Contract for mechanical work
on second floor of Original Courthouse with
Dean E. Norris, Inc.; Amount - $77,950

ACTION: Take such action as the Board of County
Commissioners deem to be in the best
interest of the general public.

b. Contract with Delamater, Freund and Scherer
to prepare the staking instructions on the
sewage collection system at Mid-Continent
Industrial Park I for the cost of $3,149.00
and control points on street improvements
at the cost of $450.00.

ACTION: Take such action as the Board of County
Commissioners deem to be in the best
interest of the general public.

5. Petition for Street Improvements at Mid-Continent
Industrial Park II

ACTION: Take such action as the Board of County
Commissioners deem to be in the best
interest of the general public.

6. Petition for Sewage Collection System at Mid-
Continent Industrial Park II

ACTION: Take such action as the Board of County
Commissioners deem to be in the best
interest of the general public.

Report of the Board of Bids and Contracts

ACTION: Take such action as the Board of County
Commissioners deem to be in the best
interest of the general public.




COUNTY OF SEDGWICK
Controller

ROOM 316

COuNTY COURTHOUSE, WICHITA, KANSAS . 872013 L] TELEPHONE 208-7501 o

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

RE: REGULAR MEETING OF THE BOARD OF BIDS & CONTRACTS -
October 20, 1977

MEMBERS PRESENT: CECIL COPE, CONTROLLER, CHAIRMAN
GROVER McLURE, DIRECTOR OF PUBLIC WORKS
BETTE McCART, REGISTER OF DEEDS
ROBERT HORNUNG, DISTRICT ATTORNEY'S OFFICE
JAMES PATTINSON, ASSISTANT COUNTY COUNSELOR
JOE COTTON, DISTRICT COURT

* Indicates Low Bid

Bill Anderson, Purchasing Officer, appeared before the Board and stated all
items he deemed necessary to publish had been properly published, and also stated
all items being considered by the Board should be approved subject to the avail-
ability of funds except for Item #2 which is the Sheriff's nine road patrol cars
which will be purchased from a grant.

Bill Anderson stated he had an off agenda item for Public Works which he would
like the Board to hear first thing. Bette McCart so moved; Robert Hornung seconded
the motion. The vote was unanimous with Grover McLure abstaining as Director of
Public Works.

Bill Anderson stated the off agenda item is for the repair of a caterpillar
tractor.

Grover McLure stated tlie repair of the caterpillar tractor is an emergency since
it 1s necessary for Public Works to get this machine back into the fleet and requested
the Board approve this as a sole source item for $7,212.68 from Foley Tractor Company.

Paul Barron, Public Works, appeared hefore the Board and stated the caterpillar
tractor is in use at all times and the County cannot supply the parts nor labor for
this repair.

Upon the statements made, Robert Hornung moved to approve this item as an
emergency and accept the bid from Foley Tractor Company for $7,212.68 as a sole source;
Joe Cotton seconded the motion. The vote was unanimous with Grover McLure abstaining
as Director of Public Works.




Minutes - Board of Bids Meeting
10/20/77

October 20, 1977

Page #2°

SEDGWICK COUNTY - Trash Service

Bill Anderson read the following bids for the four (4) County locations; 1.e.,
0ld Courthouse, New Courthouse, Youth Holding Center, and E.B. Allen Memorial
Hospital.

PER MONTH
A-1 Trash Service $ 525.00
Browning-Ferris $ 677.00
Bud Palmer $ 500.00
McCray Trash Co. $ 549.00
Park Rite Refuse $ 520.00
*Barnes Trash Co. $ 230.00
Bud Redmon NO BID
Busy Bee Trash Co. NO BID

It was noted there is a large difference in the low bid in comparisen to the
other bids received; therefore, Purchasing was requested to verify the bid of
Barnes Trash Company did meet all specifications and report back to the Chairman

that before he meets with the County Commission on Wednesday, October 26, 1977.

Grover McLure moved to accept the low bid meeting specifications; Robert Hornung
seconded the motion. The vote was unanimous.

SHERIFF - Nine Road Patrol Cars

Bill Anderson read the following bids:

Suburban Ford Inc. $ 48,746.97
**Merle Yost Ford $ 50,526.00
Rusty Eck ‘Furd $ 50,668.02
*Kellogg-Ch;:ysler Plymouth $ 47,332.26

**Merle Yost submitted an alternate bid of
$53,424.00 which exceeded the specifications.

b . % > - T 0 agate M s L "

b A ; S 3.&@&‘3_}:-,:‘-.'.\_:“

. % : e e
AN RN




Minutes - Board of Bids Meeting
i of 10/20/77

October 20, 1977

Page #3

SHERIFF - Nine Road Patrol Cars (Cont.)

Sam Davison, Undersheriff, appeared before the Board and stated the patrol
cars will be purchased through a grant from the Kansas Highway Coordinating Office.
e reconmended the Board approve the purchase from Suburban Ford Inc. for $48,746.97
since the Sheriff's Department had purchased Plymouths in the past and have had
"terrlble experiences" in maintaining them.

Paul Barron stated the sixteen 1977 Plymouths the County had purchased in
past few months, have required more warranty work than any other cars in the shop.
lle stated in checking with the Highway Patrol and the Kansas Turnpike, they had
expressed the same opinion. He further stated Public Works desires Fords because
they have parts in stock and Fords have proven to have less malntenance problems.
James Pattinson asked Paul Barron if the specifications for the 1978 automobiles
were the same.as those for the 1977 Plymouths that were being described as a
"terrible experience". Paul Barron responded that the only difference were wiring
requirements in the cars roof lining and a different color of paint on the doors.

Upon the statements made, Grover McLure moved to accept the bid of Suburban
Ford for $48,746.97 subject to approval of the Highway Coordinating Office and based
on the County's experience in maintaining cars; Bette McCart seconded the motion.
The motion carried with Cecil Cope and James Pattinson voting "No".

Twelve vendors contacted; four responses.

PUBLLC WORKS (Highway Division) - One 1978 Automobile

Bill Anderson read the following bids which do include the trade-in allowance:

Rusty Eck Ford $ 3,869.68
Merle Yost Ford $ 4,118.28
*Suburban Ford $ 3,405.32

Kellogg-Chrysler $ 3,682.28

Robert Hornung moved to accept the low bid of Suburban Ford for $3,405.32;
James Pattinson seconded the motion. The vote was unanimous. Grover McLure was
temporarily absent and did not vote.

Twelve vendors contacted; four responses.




Minutes - Board of Bids Meeting
of 10/20/77

October 20, 1977

Page 4

CARE OF PRISONERS - Commercial Washing Machine & Dryer

Bill Anderson read the following bids:
*Columbia Laundry $2,160.00
#**Jenson Commercial $2,953.00
Livingston Industrial $3,235.00
Al's Service $4,315.00
**Jenson Commercial submitted an alternate bid of a
gas dryer for $3,007.00, plus included an additional
amount of $145.00 for a required metal base 1f their

electric dryer bid was accepted.

Grover McLure moved to accept the low bld of Columbia Laundry for $2,160.00;
Robert Hornung seconded the motion. The vote was unanimous.

Eight vendors contacted; four responses.

DISTRICT ATTORNEY - Transcribing & Dictating Units

Bill Anderson stated the bids will be subject to GCCA approval.

Robert Hornung stated he had been asked to relay to the Board by his department
that the bids should be forwarded to GCCA and no action will be required by
Purchasing or the Board of Bids.

Bill Anderson stated he felt even though these items are being funded by GCCA,
the County's charter resolution on purchasing procedures still applies to any
and all purchases made by the County; thus, all purchases must go through the
Purchasing Department.

After inquiring of Bob Hornung and learning that one week's delay would not

be critical to this purchase, Cecil Cope moved to table this Ltem tor one week
and allow the Legal Department and Purchasing Department to contact GCCA to
verify whether the bids had to be forwarded to GCCA unopened; Grover McLure
seconded the motion. The vote was unanimous with Robert Hornung abstaining as
a representative from the District Attorney's Office.

It was later noted by the Chairman, that GCCA
procedures require all bids to be opened by the
grantee (the County), which requirements he read
into the taped minutes. There was a consensus that
the matter should remain tabled for one week since
vendors responding to this item had left the meeting
when this matter was previously tabled.
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Minutes - Board of Bids Meeting
of 10/20/77

October 20, 1977

Page #5

CIVIL PREPAREDNESS - One Air Raid Siren

Bill Anderson reported the following responses to a request for bids:
#*American Fire Equipment SEE BELOW
Kansas Fire Equipment NO BID
Law Enforcement Equipment $3,814.38
*Tri-County Electric $3,500.00
**American Fire -Equipment was ruled an "invalid" bid since
they did not include installation which the specifications

required.

Robert Hornung moved to accept the low bid of Tri-County Electric for
$3,500.00; Grover McLure seconded the motion. The vote was unanimous.

Seven vendors contacted; four responses.

ELECTION COMMISSIONER - Return Sheet Packs

Bill Anderson stated the only bid received was from AVM Corporation for
$7,250.00.

Grover McLure so moved to accept the only bid received; Joe Cotton seconded
the motion. The vote was unanimous.

Three vendors contacted; one response.

COURT UNIFICATION & EXPANSION - DISTRICT COURT - Filing Cabinets

Bill Anderson read the following bids:
*Goldsmith's $5,503.71
Scott Rice $5,879.00

Southwestern Office $6,094.,10%*

**Mistakenly reported as total of $'8,51&.50 at meeting;
later tabulated and corrected.

Grover McLure moved to accept the low bid of Goldsmith's for $5,503.71;
Robert Hornung seconded the motion. The vote was unanimous with Joe Cotton
abstaining as representative from the Courts.

Four vendors contacted; three responses.
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Minutes - Board of Bids Meeting
of 10/20/77

October 20, 1977

Page {6

COURT UNIFICATION AND EXPANSION - DISTRICT COURT — Tables, Chairs, & Sofa

Bill Anderson read the following bids:
*Goldsmith's $8,013.22
*%Scott Rice SEE BELOW

**Scott Rice withdrew their bid upon statments by Don
Farr, as below, and because they would not bid the
sofa.

Don Farr, District Court Administrator, appeared before the Board and
stated "Marble" furniture was requested in the specifications because they
carry a "life-time" guarantee and th= Furniture being bid must conform to
the furniture now in use. He further stated the furniture being requested
would be in heavy use and "Marble" furniture can be replaced if it should
become damaged. The Chairman asked if the bids could be treated on a per
item basis, but Mr. Farr insisted all items of furniture must be "Marble"
cven though they will not be in the same room. He recommended the Board
accept this item as a sole source from Goldsmith's.

Upon the statements made, Robert Hornung moved to accept the bid of
Goldsmith's for $8,013.22; Grover McLure seconded the motion, The motion
carried with Cecil Cope and Bette McCart voting "No" and Joe Cotton abstaining
as representative from the Courts.

Four vendors contacted; two responses.

COURT UNIFICATION AND EXPANSION - DISTRICT COURT - Chairs

Bill Anderson read the following bids:
*Goldsmith's $1,648.28
Scott Rice $1,891.00
Southwestern Office $1,923.45
Bette McCart moved to accept the low bid of Goldsmith's for $1,648.28;
Grover McLure seconded the motion. The vote was unamous with Joe Cotton

abstaining as representative from the Courts.

Four vendors contacted; three responses.
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Minutes - Board of Bids Meeting
of 10/20/77

October 20, 1977

Page {7

COURY UNIFLCATION AND EXPANSION — DISTRICT COURT - Desks

Bill Anderson read the following bids:

Goldsmith's $3,870.42

*Scott Rice $2,982.00

Southwestern Office $3,451.70
Grover McLure moved to accept the low bid of Scott Rice for $2,982.00;
Bette McCart seconded the motion. The vote was unanimous with Joe Cotton ab-
staining as representative of the Courts.
Four vendors contacted; three responses.
COURT UNIFICATION AND EXPANSION - DISTRICT COURT - Filing Cabinets (Judge Howard Kline)

Bill Anderson read the following bids:

Goldsmith's $2,832.72
Scott Rice $2,880.00
*Southwestern $2,612,80
Grover McLure moved to accept the low bid of Southwestern Office Supply for
$2,612.80; Robert Hornung seconded the motion. The vote was unanimous with Joe
Cotton abstaining as representative from the Courts.

Four vendors contacted; three responses.

COURT UNIFICATION AND EXPANSION - DISTRICT COURT - Lateral File System

Don Farr stated the files being requested will have to conform with the
cxisting system as the present counter will be used and the files must be able
to fit under the counter.
Bill Anderson read the bids received:
Goldsmith's $4,049,88
#*Scott Rice $3,751.00
Robert Hornung moved to accept the low bid of Scott Rice for $3,751.00; Bette
MeCart seconded the motion. The vote was unanimous with Joe Cotton abstaining as
representative from the Courts.

Four vendors contacted; two responses.




Minutes - Board of Bids Meeting
of 10/20/77

October 20, 1977

Page 8

COURT UNIFICATION & EXPANSTION - DISTRICT COURT - (Criminal & Domestic) - Furniture

Bill Anderson read the bids received:
Goldsmith's §913.50
*Scott Rice $874.20
Southwestern $981.16
Grover McLure moved to accept the low bid of Scott Rice for $874.20; Bette
McCart seconded the motion. The vote was unanimous with Joe Cotton abstaining
as representative from the Courts.

Four vendors contacted; three responses.

COURT UNIFICATION & LEXPANSION - DISTRICT COURT (CRIMINAL & DOMESTIC) - Files

Don Farr, again, appeared before the Board and stated the bid accepted must
conform to the existing files now in use.

Bill Anderson stated the bid of Southwestern Office Supply does not meet the
specifications; therefore, it was ruled an invalid bid. He stated the only valid
bid received was from Scott Rice for $6,942,00. Goldsmith's responded: No bid.

Bette McCart moved to accept the bid of Scott Rice for $6,942.00; Robert
llornung seconded the motion. The vote was unanimous with Joe Cotton abstaining
as representative from the Courts.

Four vendors contacted; three responses.

At this point, the Chairman suggested the Board hear Item #18 (the last item
on the agenda) which also pertains to District Court.

COURT UNIFICATION & EXPANSION - DISTRICT COURT - Docket Sheets

Bill Anderson read the following bids:
Acme Lithographers Inc. $3,584
Duke Printing Co. $3,504
*Sharpe Printing Co. $2,910
Grover McLure moved to accept the low bid of Sharpe Printing Co. for §2,910.00;
Robert Hornung seconded the motion. The vote was unanimous with Joe Cotton ab-

staining as representative. from the Courts.

Three vendors contacted; thrce responses.
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Minutes - Board of Bids Meeting
of 10/20/77

October 20, 1977

Page #9

PUBLIC WORKS - C.M.A.C. Pipe and End Sections

Bill Anderzon read the bids received:
*Bush Hog-Eaton Metal Products $4,231.44
Armco Steel Corp. $4,741.88
J&J Metal Corp. $4,704.40
Bette McCart moved to accept the low bid of Bush Hog-Eaton Metal Products
for $4,231,44; Robert Hornung seconded the motion. The vote was unanimous with
Grover McLure abstaining as Director of Public Works.
Three vendors contacted; three responses.

PUBLIC WORKS - Concrete Pipe

Bill Anderson stated the only bid received was from the Mileon Corporation
for $4,107.60.

Robert Hornung moved to accept the only bid received; Bette McCart seconded
the motion. The vote was unanimous with Grover McLure abstaining as Director of
Public Works.

Four vendors contacted; one response.

Respectfully submitted,

CECIL CQOPE, CHA
b h

Vi

SUE GRIFFIN, SECRETARY
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EXCERPT FROM THE PLANNING COMMISSION MINUTES OF OCTOBER 13, 1977

4. DR 77-24 - Sedgwick County Department of Public Works
requests a street name change for Edna Street as platted
in Evermoor Addition. Genera11§ located on the west side

of Karren Lane, in an area south of Central.

GALBRAITH pointed out that there is an Edna Street already
existing in the City of Wichita.

BELL commented that there were 13 familes living on the
other Edna Street as pointed out in the Subdivision Committee
weting, and that three were addressed on the street in question.

WEBSTER BOURN, JR., 10909 W. Edna, was opposed to the
street name change and stated that every family living on
Edna was against the name change. He said that the other
Edna Street cannot be extended, it would run into May Street.
There are other streets in Wichita that do not line up either.
He asked what would happen if an emergency vehicle is needed,
such as a fire truck, ambulance or taxicab and they could not
find Binter (proposed street name).

GREIDER assured Mr. Bourn that the Fire Department is the
first agency to be notified of street name changes.

BOURN stated that he has worked with the Fire Department
and the first thing they do is grab a map and if the new name
is not listed, then it is their impression that its a false
alarm. They do memorize the streets, but a fill-in officer
might miss it.

MAY asked how long has the Edna streets existed.

LAKIN remarked that they both have existed since the
mid 50's.

SAVINA suggested that the street name be changed to Edna
Lane.

MRS. JOSEPH NEDEAU, 10901 W. Edna, stated that was going
to be her suggestion also.

COLE asked what kind of occupation is addressed in this
residential area. BOURN stated an excavation business.

MOTION: That the Planning Commission
recommend to the County Commission that
Edna Street be changed to Edna Lane.
Savina moved, Hennessy seconded and it
carried by a vote of 8 in favor (Barrier,
Bayouth, Taylor, Greider, Hartstein,
Hennessy, May and Savina) and 2 opposed
(Bell and Cole).
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HEST

METROPOLITAN AREA PLANNING
DEPARTMENT
CITY HALL — TENTH FLOOR
455 NORTH MAIN STREET
WICHITA, KANSAS 87202
(31€) 2884581 October 19, 1977

Board of County Commissioners
320 Sedgwick County Courthouse
Wichita, Kansas 67203
Re: DR 77-24 - Street Name Change
Edna Street to Binter.

Gentlemen

At the regualr meeting of the Metropolitan Area Planning Commission
on October 13, 1977, the above proposed street name change was
considered. It was the action of the Commission to recommend that
Edna Street as platted in Evermoor Addition, be changed to Edna
Lane after hearing from those who have addresses on this street
and the inconvenience the change to Binter would have caused them.

It is requested that this matter be placed on your agenda for the
regular meeting of the Commission on October 26, 1977. Minutes
of the Planning Commission meeting are herewith enclosed.

If the recommendation is approved, it is requested that the
Resolution be passed and approved making the street name changes
effective.

Respectfully submitted,

N

H. Galbraith
Planner
Current Plans Division
JHG:CLN:rme
Encl.

cc: Dorothy K. White, County Clerk
Syd Werbin, Director, County Building, Planning ‘& Inspection
Theodore H. Hill, County Counselor




EXCERPT FROM THE PLANNING COMMISSION MINUTES OF OCTOBER 13, 1977

4. DR 77-24 - sedgwick County Department of Public Works
requests a street name change for Edna Street as platted

in Evermoor Addition. Generallﬁ located on the west side
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existing in the City of Wichita.
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carried by a vote of 8 in favor (Barrier,
Bayouth, Taylor, Greider, Hartstein,
Hennessy, May and Savina) and 2 opposed
(Bell and Cole).
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RESOLUTION

A RESOLUTION CHANGING THE NAME OF A STREET
IN SEDGWICK COUNTY, KANSAS, AND REPEALING
ALL ORDINANCES AND/OR RESOLUTIONS OR PARTS
THEREOF IN CONFLICT HEREWITH.

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COM-
MISSIONERS OF SEDGWICK COUNTY, KANSAS:

°  SECTION I. That after hearing the recommendation of
the Wichita-Sedgwick County Metropolitan Area Planning Commission,
the name of Edna Lane should be, and the same is hereby changed
from and after the effective date of this Resolution, and shall
be known, named, and designated by the respective new name as
follows, to-wit:

Edna Street, as platted in Evermoor
Addition, be changed to Edna Lane.

SECTION II. That all other names previously assigned,
either officially or otherwise to this street, are hereby made
null and void.

SECTION III. This Resolution shall take effect and be
in force from and after its adoption and publication.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of County Commissioners
of Sedgwick County, at Wichita, Kansas this , day of
1

’ .

Tom Scott, Chairman

John Hale, Commissioner

Everett Patrick, Commissioner

ATTEST:

Dorothy K. White, County Clerk

(SEAL)

Approved as to form by:

Theodore H. Hill, County Counselor
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RESOLUTION

A RESOLUTION CHANGING THE NAME OF A STREET
IN SEDGWICK COUNTY, KANSAS, AND REPEALING
ALL ORDINANCES AND/OR RESOLUTIONS OR PARTS
THEREOF IN CONFLICT HEREWITH.

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COM-
MISSIONERS OF SEDGWICK COUNTY, KANSAS:

SECTION I. That after hearing the recommendation of
the Wichita-Sedgwick County Metropolitan Area Planning Commission,
the name of Edna Lane should be, and the same is hereby changed
from and after the effective date of this Resolution, and shall
be known, named, and designated by the respective new name as
follows, to-wit:

Edna Street, as platted in Evermoor
Addition, be changed to Edna Lane.

SECTION II. That all other names previously assigned,
either officially or otherwise to this street, are hereby made
null and void.

SECTION III. This Resolution shall take effect and be
in force from and after its adoption and publication.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of County Commissioners

of Sedgwick County, at Wichita, Kansas this % day of
_ﬁh@ ¢ 1977.

Everett Patrick, Commissioner

Approved as to form by:

M

Theodore H. Hill, County Counselor
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RESOLUTION

A RESOLUTION CHANGING THE NAME OF A STREET
IN SEDGWICK COUNTY, KANSAS, AND REPEALING
ALL ORDINANCES AND/OR RESOLUTIONS OR PARTS
THEREOF IN CONFLICT HEREWITH.

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY COM-
MISSIONERS OF SEDGWICK COUNTY, KANSAS:

SECTION I. That after hearing the recommendation of
the Wichita-Sedgwick County Metropolitan Area Planning Commission,
the name of Edna Lane should be, and the same is hereby changed
from and after the effective date of this Resolution, and shall
be known, named, and designated by the respective new name as
follows, to-wit:

Edna Street, as platted in Evermoor
Addition, be changed to Edna Lane.

SECTION II. That all other names previously assigned,
either officially or otherwise to this street, are hereby made
null and void. :

SECTION III. This Resolution shall take effect and be
in force from and after its adoption and publication.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Board of County Commissioners
of Sedgwick County,.at Wichita, Kansas this day of
1977.
’

Tom Scott, Chairman

John Hale, Commissioner

Everett Patrick, Commissioner

ATTEST:

Dorothy K. White, County Clerk

(SEAL)

Approved as to form by:

Theodore H. HilI, County Counselor
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October 19, 1977

Board of County Commissioners
320 Bedgwick County Courthouse
Wichita, Kansas 67203

Re: DR 77-24 - Street Name Change
Edna Street to Binter.

Gentlemen:

At the regualr meeting of the Metropolitan Area Planning Commission
on October 13, 1977, tha above proposed street name change was
considered. It was the action of the Commission to recommend that
Edna Street as platted in Evermoor Addition, be changed to Edna
Lane after hear from those who have addresses on this street

and the inconvenience the change to Binter would have caused them.

It is requested that this matter be placed on your agenda for the
regular meeting of the Commission on October 26, 1977. Minutes
of the Planning Commission meeting are herewith enclosed.

If the recommendation is approved, it is requested that the
:::::m be passed and approved making the street name changes
Ve .

Respectfully submitted,

Jack H. Galbraith
Chief Planner
Current Plans Division
JHG :CLN :rme
Enel.

cc: Doxothy K. White, County Clerk
8yd Werbin, Director, County Building, Planning & Inspection
Theodore H., Hill, County Counselor




EXCERPT FROM THE PLANNING COMMISSION MINUTES OF OCTOBER 13, 1977

4. DR 77-24 - Sedgwick County Department of Public Works
requests a street name change for Edna Street as platted
in Evermoor Addition. Generally located on the west side

__ﬁ_f___._l_.—

of Karren Lane, in an area south of Central.

GALBRAITH pointed out that there is an Edna Street already
existing in the City of Wichita.

BELL commented that there were 13 familes living on the
other Edna Street as pointed out in the Subdivision Committee
meeting, and that three were addressed on the street in question.

WEBSTER BOURN, JR., 10909 W. Edna, was opposed to the
street name change and stated that every family living on
Edna was against the name change. He said that the other
Edna Street cannot be extended, it would run into May Street.
There are other streets in Wichita that do not line up either.
He asked what would happen if an emergency vehicle is needed,
such as a fire truck, ambulance or taxicab and they could not
find Binter (proposed street name).

GREIDER assured Mr. Bourn that the Fire Department is the
first agency to be notified of strest name changes.

BOURN stated that he has worked with the Fire Department
and the first thing they do is grab a map and if the new name
is not listed, then it is their impression that its a false
alarm. They do memorize the streets, but a fill-in officer
might miss it.

MAY asked how long has the Edna streets existed.

LAKIN remarked that they both have existed since the
mid 50's. s

SAVINA suggested that the street name be changed to Edna
Lane.

MRS. JOSEPH NEDEAU, 10901 W. Edna, stated that was going
to be her suggestion also.

COLE asked what kind of occupation is addressed in this
residential area. BOURN stated an excavation business.

MOTION: That the Planning Commission
recommend to the County Commission that
Edna Street be changed to Edna Lane.
Savina moved, Hennessy seconded and it
carried by a vote of 8 in favor (Barrier,
Bayouth, Taylor, Greider, Hartstein,
Hennessy, May and Savina) and 2 opposed
(Bell and Cole).




October 15, 1977

Mrs. Vera Stevens
Administrative Supervisor
County Public Works Department
Sedgwick County Courthouse

525 North Main

Wichita, Kansas 67203

Re: Case No. 77-24 - Street
Name Change from Edna
Street to Binter

Dear Mrs. Stevens:

This is to advise you that the above referred to street name
change was considered by the Metropolitan Area Planning Commis-
sion at their regular meeting on October 13, 1977. After hear-
ing from those who have addresses on this street and the incon-
venience the change to Binter would cause them, the action of the
Planning Commission was to recommend that Edna Street be changed
to Edna Lane.

Inasmuch as there is another Edna Street in an area north of

May and east of K-42, I am not convinced that just changing street
to lane on subject street will resolve potential confusion as to
the location of these two streets.

Should the County Public Works Department and the County Fire
Department feel that the change to Edna Lane is still confusing,
they should be represented at the County Commission meeting.

This matter will be forwarded to the Board of County Commissioners
for consideration at their regular meeting of October 26, 1977; this
meeting will be held in Room 320, Sedgwick County Courthouse, begin-
ning at 9:00 a.m.

If you have any questions, please call.

Sincerely yours,

Jack H. Galbraith
JHG:bh Chief Planner
cc: Jack Brannan, 10900 W. Edna, 67212
Joseph Nedeau, 10901 W. Edna, 67212
Webster Bourn, Jr., 10909 W. Edna, 67212




Mrs. Vera Stevens

October 15, 1977

cc:

Joe Freeman, County Bldg., Planning & Insp.
Dean Sellers, Assistant City Engineer

G. C. McLure, Director of County Public Works
County Fire Chief, Gary Nichols

Chris Brennensthul, County Engineering




October 12, 1977

Re: DR 77-24 - Raguest for
strest name change for
Edna Street as platted
in Evermcor tion.

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN:

At the rmh: u-t.l.ng of the Subdivision Committee of the
= up:l.:md cm:lmt;pan b “H' :g.

was acn exed.
mmumc_umnawwm

requested street name change be approved from !dnl to Binter.

This matter will be forwarded to the Planning Commission for
its consideration en Thursday, October 13, 1’?1. at 1:30 p.m,
::1 {OI should have any questions concerning this matter, pleass

Sincerely,

Curtis L. Newby
Junior Planner
CLi :xme

©o: Jack Brannan, 10900 W. Edna, 67212
Joseph Nedeau, 10901 W. Bdna, 67212
Webater Bourn, Jr.. 10909 W. Bdna, 67212
Jos Freeman, ty Building, Ilm.tn' & Inspection
Dean uu-r-. Mmmt City Eng




September 30, 1977

Re: DR 77-24 -~ Request for
street name change for
Edna Street as platted
in Evermoor Addition.

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN :

An application for the street name change of the above referred
to street will be considered by the Subdivision Committee of
the Metropolitan Area Planning Commission at a meeting to be
held on Thursday, October 6, 1977, at 1:00 p.m., First Floor,
City Hall, 455 North Main, Wichita, Kansas.

You are invited to attend-this meeting and discuss with the
members of the Committee your feelings as to whether or not
this street name change should be approved.

Sincerely,

Curtis L. Newby
Junior Planner
CLN:rme
Enc.

cc: Jack Brannan, 10900 W. Edna, 67212
Joseph Nedeau, 10901 W. Edna, 67212
Webster Bourn, Jr., 10909 W. Edna, 67212
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COUNTY OF SEDGWICK
DEPARTMENT OF FUBLIC WORKS

1018 STILLWELL
WICHITA. KANSAS 67213 PHONE 268-7201

G C MCLURE JR.PE "‘3’>‘\'\§ {

COUNTY ENGINEER/DIRECTOR OF PUBLIC WORKS

September 22, 1977

SEDGWICK COUNTY COURTHOUSE

i o
w\\? RecewED
[~ sSEp 23 197

Mr. Curtis Newby
Junior Planner
Metropolitan Planning Department
455 No. Main
Wichita, Kansas 67202
Re: Street name change for Edna
as platted in Evermoor Add.

Dear Curtis:

Tt has been called to my attention that we have two Edna Streets - one in
Downtain's Addition and one in Evermoor Addition. These two streets do

not align with each other.

Therefore,

N 1% oo i Bty o e <y, Lo

The one in Evermoor Addition does align with Binter in the City.
we would like it changed to Binter.

The owners for the three existing addresses on Edna are:
N

Iot 1, Blk 3, Jack Brannan - 10900 W. Edna
Lot 1, Blk 2, Joseph Nedeau - 10901 W. Edna
Lot 2, Blk 2, T. Webster Bourn, Jr. - 10909 W. Edna

Thank you, ;

Vera Stevens
Administrative Supervisor
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March 8, 1977

Ms. Chris Brennenstuhl

Sedgwick County Public Works Department
1015 Stillwell

Wichita, Kansas 67213

Dear Ms. Brennenstuhl:

This is to relay certain information about two di fferently located
Edna Streets within Sedgwick County.

Edna Street within the city 1imits of Wichita is an east-west street
1ying east of Sheridan and one block north of May Street in Downtain's
Addition. Downtain's Addition was platted in May 1955. There are
fourteen (14) residences addressed on this street.

Edna Street in the county 1ies one block south of Central and west of
Karren in Evermoor Addition. Evermoor Additfon was platted in July
1956, There are three (3) residences addressed on this street.
Considering the above information and particularly the effect to the
residents, 1t 1s recommended that Edna Street in the county south of
Central and west of Karren be changed to Binter. This will require
only three residences to change their address.

Please contact me if there is any additional information or questions
our office can help you with or any action that you may take to help

resolve this situation.
Yours truly, 5
P / r///‘ >
Jf/(?% freror—

Robert E. Vinson
Public Works Administrator

/ml

cc: Curtis Newby, Planning Department
R. W. Bruggeman, Director of Public Works

APPROVED:

. N. Bruggeman, rec C Works




