CITY OF WICHITA, KANSAS
OVERSIZE -- OVERWEIGHT PERMIT - SINGLE TRIP

ATS- 10-31-22=)

A0AR-ob2

Name of Mover Street Address, City, State Tel. No.

ATS Specialized, INC 725 Opportunity Drive, St. Cloud, MN 56301 800-328-2316

Towing Vehicle is a State and License No. Licensed Capacity No. of Axles

2021 - PETERBILT 16357 IN - 3210254 85,500 4

5 State and License No. No. of Axles
_X_Semi-Trailer __ Pole-Trailer __ Full Trailer __ Mobile Home IN - PB66710 4

Permit Requested for Dimensions of Vehicles and Loads Total Weight of Vehicle and Load
_X_Overlength _X_Overwidth _X_Overheight _X_ Overweight Length 92' Width 12' Height 14'6" 150,000

Name of Company Insuring Towing Vehicle City, State Policy No.

GREAT WEST CASUALTY CO INVERNESS, IL GWP04319T

Amount of Property Damage Insurance Amount of Public Liability Insurance

$2,000,000 $2,000,000

Starting Point Destination

KS-42 1550 S WEST ST

Route To Be Followed

KS-42, SOUTHWEST DRIVE, WEST STREET

Date of Move Permit Fee |Received By How paid

10/31/2022 $55.00 k)%/ cC __Cash  __Check  _ Biled  __ OnAccount
Additional Regulations

This permit is granted subject to all regulations contained in the current General Policy for Issuance of Special Permits of the City
of Wichita, Kansas. NOTE: All other local and Kansas Department of Transportation regulations must be complied with.

| certify that the above information is true and correct and that | am acting as agent for the above company or individual or | am the
owner of the towing vehicle. | hereby agree to abide by all of the regulations of this permit.
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Jo-28-22
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Applicant's Signature



WICHITA PBLC WRK ENGIN

455 N MAIN
WICHITA, KS 67202

10/31/2022 141115

CREDIT CARD

MC SALE

Card # KXXXKKKXXT 160
SEQ #: |
Batch #: 1661
INVOICE 3
Approval Code: 391307
Entry Method: Manual
Mode: Online
Tax Amount: 5000
Cust Code: 035
SALE AMOUNT 695,00

CUSTOMER COPY



Zante, Virginia

From: Deb Janssen <debja@ATS-INC.com>
Sent: Monday, October 31, 2022 9:12 AM
To: Zapote, Virginia; Smith, Andrew

Cc: Deb Janssen

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR A CITY PERMIT

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Good Morning Virginia,
What number should I call to pay for the permit?
Or my direct number is 320-258-8077

Thank you,

Debra A Janssen

HH Permit Coordinator

P: 320-258-8077 or 800-328-2316 x8077
F: 320-258-2835

Email: debja@ATS-INC.com

highway maritime projects logistics

From: Zapote, Virginia <VZapote@wichita.gov>

Sent: Friday, October 28, 2022 3:55 PM

To: Smith, Andrew <ASMITH@wichita.gov>; Deb Janssen <debja@ATS-INC.com>
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR A CITY PERMIT

Deb | will need to collect payment and send the permit and receipt on Monday

Thank you,

Verginia Gapote

From: Smith, Andrew <ASMITH@wichita.gov>

Sent: Friday, October 28, 2022 3:53 PM

To: Deb Janssen <debja@ATS-INC.com>; Zapote, Virginia <VZapote @wichita.gov>
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR A CITY PERMIT




Yes this route is approved.

Andrew Smith
Engineering Tech 2
City of Wichita
268-4275
asmith@wichita.gov

From: Deb Janssen <debja@ATS-INC.com>

Sent: Friday, October 28, 2022 10:17 AM

To: Smith, Andrew <ASMITH@wichita.gov>; Zapote, Virginia <VZapote @wichita.gov>
Cc: Deb Janssen <debja @ATS-INC.com>

Subject: REQUEST FOR A CITY PERMIT

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Good Morning,
Attached is an application for a city permit.

Thank you,

Debra A Janssen

HH Permit Coordinator

P: 320-258-8077 or 800-328-2316 x8077
F: 320-258-2835

Email: debja@ATS-INC.com

highway maritime projects logistics

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely
for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have
received this email in error please notify the system manager. This message
contains confidential information and is intended only for the individual named.
If you are not the named addressee you should not disseminate, distribute or copy
this email. Please notify the sender immediately by email if you have received
this email by mistake and delete this email from your system. If you are not the
intended recipient you are notified that disclosing, copying, distributing or
taking any action in reliance on the contents of this information is strictly
prohibited.
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