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CITY OF WICHITA, KANSAS
OVERSIZE -- OVERWEIGHT PERMIT - SINGLE TRIP 2522

Name of Mover

Belger Cartage Service, Inc.

Street Address, City, State

2555 S Kessler, Wichita, KS 67217

Tel. No.

316-943-0101

Towing Vehicle is a State and License No. Licensed Capacity No. of Axes

Freightliner Semi Tractor OK 2UV834 UNIT 230 85,500 3

Towed Vebhicle is a State and License No. No. of Axles
_X_Semi-Trailer __ Pole-Trailer __ Full Trailer __ Mobile Home MO PH5-1 77, unit 35610 3

Permit Requested for Dimensions of Vehicles and Loads Total Weight of Vehicle and Load

__Overlength __x Overwidth __X Overheight _x_ Overweight Length 68 Width 16 Height 15'6" 84,000
Name of Company Insuring Towing Vehicle City, State Policy No.
Brier Payne Meade Inurance, Inc. Overland Park, KS CRA55000049

Amount of Property Damage Insurance

Amount of Public Liability Insurance

Starting Point

4400 N Seneca

Destination

255 N Hoover Road

Route To Be Followed

South on Seneca to 40th St N., West to Meridian, South to 21st St N, West to West St. South to Douglas,

West to Hoover Road, North to Destination

Date of Move Permit Fee

$55.00

9/30/2022

Received By

V&

How paid

C/C/ __Cash

__Check

__Billed __ On Account

Additional Regulations

This permit is granted subject to all regulations contained in the current General Policy for Issuance of Special Permits of the City
of Wichita, Kansas. NOTE: All other local and Kansas Department of Transportation regulations must be complied with.

| certify that the above information is true and correct and that | am acting as agent for the above company or individual or | am the
owner of the towing vehicle. | hereby agree to abide by all of the regulations of this permit.

Authorized By

o

NE

Date

Qs

2> 10 2004l

\

X John W Doesken - Belger Cartage Service Inc

Applicant's Signature




WICHITA PBLC WRK ENGIN

455 N MAIN
WICHITA, KS 67202

09/28/2022 13:31:35

CREDIT CARD

MC SALE

Card # XXXKXKKXXKXXB 131
SEQ #: 5
Batch #: 1639
INVOICE 5
Approval Code: 931345
Entry Method: Manual
Mode: Online
Tax Amount; 50.00
Cust Code: 967
SALE AMOUNT 85500

CUSTOMER COPY



Zapote, Virginia
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From: Smith, Andrew
Sent: Tuesday, September 20, 2022 2:12 PM
To: Zapote, Virginia
Subject: RE: Single Trip Permit Application for move on 9-29

Approved, thank you!

Andrew Smith
Engineering Tech 2
City of Wichita
268-4275
asmith@wichita.gov

From: Zapote, Virginia <VZapote@wichita.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, September 20, 2022 2:08 PM

To: Smith, Andrew <ASMITH@wichita.gov>

Subject: Fwd: Single Trip Permit Application for move on 9-29

Please review
Thank you

Virginia Zapote

Traffic Investigator Tech | PWU
City of Wichita | 455 N Main
316.268.4276

From: JD Doesken <jdoesken@belger.net>

Sent: Tuesday, September 20, 2022 1:13:46 PM

To: Zapote, Virginia <VZapote @wichita.gov>

Subject: Single Trip Permit Application for move on 9-29

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Virginia,
Please let me know when this is approved and | will pay with credit card.

Thanks



Zante, Virginia

From:

Sent:

To:

Subject:
Attachments:

JD Doesken <jdoesken@belger.net>

Wednesday, September 28, 2022 10:13 AM

Zapote, Virginia

RE: Single Trip Permit Application for move on 9-29 - Revised

Copy of Copy of Oversize - Overweight Permit -- Ripley to Hoover PCC Move 10-30.xls

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the

sender and know the content is safe.

Virginia,

| need to change tractor numbers for this. | will call you in a minute to give you credit card information.

1D

John (J.D.) Doesken

Regional Project Development Manager
Belger Cartage Service, Inc.

A Century of Heavy Lifting

Office: 800-727-2547
Direct: 816-516-8925
Email: jdoesken@belger.net

2555 S Kessler
Wichita, KS 67217

www.belger.net

weene (F) @)

From: Zapote, Virginia [mailto:VZapote @wichita.gov]
Sent: Monday, September 26, 2022 1:07 PM

To: jdoesken@belger.net

Subject: Re: Single Trip Permit Application for move on 9-29

Yes, approved.

My apologies for the delay. I'll be in the office tomorrow getting everything caught up

Virginia Zapote

Traffic Investigator Tech | PWU

City of Wichita | 455 N Main

316.268.4276

From: JD Doesken <jdoesken@belger.net>

Sent: Monday, September 26, 2022 1:05:50 PM
To: Zapote, Virginia <VZapote@wichita.gov>

Subject: FW: Single Trip Permit Application for move on 9-29



CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Virginia,
Is this approved?

Thanks,

D

John (J.D.) Doesken

Regional Project Development Manager
Belger Cartage Service, Inc.

A Century of Heavy Lifting

Office: 800-727-2547
Direct: 816-516-8925
Email: jdoesken@belger.net

2555 S Kessler
Wichita, KS 67217

www.belger.net

weENe () @

From: JD Doesken [mailto:jdoesken@belger.net]

Sent: Tuesday, September 20, 2022 1:14 PM

To: 'Zapote, Virginia' <VZapote @wichita.gov>

Subject: Single Trip Permit Application for move on 9-29

Virginia,
Please let me know when this is approved and | will pay with credit card.

Thanks

John (J.D.) Doesken

Regional Project Development Manager
Belger Cartage Service, Inc.

A Century of Heavy Lifting

Office: 800-727-2547
Direct: 816-516-8925
Email: jdoesken@belger.net

2555 S Kessler
Wichita, KS 67217

www.belger.net




