menGum - 01472
CITY OF WICHITA, KANSAS

OVERSIZE -- OVERWEIGHT PERMIT - SINGLE TRIP 202

Name of Mover Street Address, City, State Tel. No.
' .

Mangum's Inc. PO Box 7177 Wilson, NC 27895 252-903-8693
Towing Vehicle is a State and License No. Licensed Capacity No. of Axles
2020 Kenworth NH3816 (NC) 85,500 4
Towed Vehicle is a State and License No. No. of Axles

_x_Semi-Trailer __ Pole-Trailer __Full Trailer __ Mobile Home 25.84378 (ME) 4
Permit Requested for Dimensions of Vehicles and Loads Total Weight of Vehicle and Load

_x_Overlength x Overwidth _x_ Overheight _x_ Overweight Length 89'11" Width 9'11" Height 14'0" 144,000

Name of Company Insuring Towing Vehicle City, State Policy No.

Clear Blue Insurance Company

AWO03-RS-2200084-02

$1,000,000

Amount of Property Damage Insurance

Amount of Public Liability Insurance

$1,000,000

Starting Point

1-135 @ 13th St.

Destination

1764 N Emporia Ave, Wichita KS

Route To Be Followed

1135S-E 13th St. N-N Emporia Ave.

Date of Move

9/29/2022

Permit Fee

$55.00

Received By How paid

Zf 0 C . _Cash  _ Check _ Biled __ OnAccount
p > =

Additional Regulations

This permit is granted subject to all regulations contained in the current General Policy for Issuance of Special Permits of the City
of Wichita, Kansas. NOTE: All other local and Kansas Department of Transportation regulations must be complied with.

| certify that the above information is true and correct and that | am acting as agent for the above company or individual or | am the
owner ofthe towin}g?hicle. | hereby a£7e to abide by all of the regulations of this permit.

X David Daniele

Applicant's Signature




WICHITA PBLC WRK ENGIN

455 N MAIN
WICHITA, KS 67202

09/28/2022 08:42:07

CREDIT CARD

VISA SALE
Card # KXXKKXXXXXXX0572
SEQ #: 3
Batch #: 1639
INVOICE 3
Approval Code: 620693
Entry Method: Manual
Mode: Online
Tax Amount; 50.00
Avs Code: NYZ
SALE AMOUNT $30.00
CUSTOMER COPY



Zante, Virginia

From: David Daniels <DavidD@mangumsinc.com>
Sent: Tuesday, September 27, 2022 12:13 PM

To: Zapote, Virginia

Cc: ProjectSales

Subject: Hauling Permit Application for 9/29
Attachments: Wichita Permit App 9-29-2022.xIs

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Good afternoon Virginia,
Please see the attached permit application for a movement that we have scheduled for this Thursday 9/29. Please let
me know if there is anything else that you need from me.

Thank you,

*please CC ProjectSales@mangumsinc.com

David Daniels

Project Manager

“Your need, Our solution”

PO Box 7177

Wilson, NC 27895

0 - 252-237-4256-opt 300

C - 252-903-8693
https://www.mangumshauling.com/
davidd@mangumsinc.com

Mangumh

TRANSPORT

This quotation is only an estimate of possible charges, is provided solely as a courtesy and convenience to the customer, and can be used as an
approximation of charges for a period not to exceed thirty days from the date of the quotation. Any changes in the load description, dimensions,
weights or scope of work requested above may alter the amount charged. Any additional services beyond those requested must be agreed upon
prior to subsequent mobilization and require separate or amended itemized Purchase Orders or Service Agreements. Charges for any special services
as required by state and local government, whether quoted or not, shall be the responsibility of the customer. Police escorts, utility equipment
charges are estimates only and will be billed based on final costs. Mangum’s Inc. will not be responsible for any direct or indirect costs incurred due
to shipping delays whether caused or not caused by its personnel or resulting from equipment failure. This quotation automatically expires 5 days
from the date of issue unless accepted prior thereto and may be amended to reflect fuel surcharges. All business transactions are based on
Mangum’s Inc. Terms and Conditions available upon request.

From: Zapote, Virginia <VZapote@wichita.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, August 30, 2022 2:40 PM

To: David Daniels <DavidD@mangumsinc.com>
Cc: ProjectSales <projectsales@mangumsinc.com>
Subject: RE: Hauling Permit Application

Permit and Receipt attached



Zaeote, Virginia

From: Smith, Andrew

Sent: Tuesday, September 27, 2022 2:09 PM
To: Zapote, Virginia

Subject: RE: Hauling Permit Application for 9/29

Looks good to me.

Andrew Smith
Engineering Tech 2
City of Wichita
268-4275
asmith@wichita.gov

From: Zapote, Virginia <VZapote @wichita.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, September 27,2022 12:17 PM
To: Smith, Andrew <ASMITH@wichita.gov>
Subject: FW: Hauling Permit Application for 9/29

Please review

Thank you.

Vinginia Gapote

From: David Daniels <DavidD@mangumsinc.com>
Sent: Tuesday, September 27,2022 12:13 PM

To: Zapote, Virginia <VZapote@wichita.gov>

Cc: ProjectSales <projectsales@mangumsinc.com>
Subject: Hauling Permit Application for 9/29

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Good afternoon Virginia,
Please see the attached permit application for a movement that we have scheduled for this Thursday 9/29. Please let
me know if there is anything else that you need from me.

Thank you,

*please CC ProjectSales@mangumsinc.com

David Daniels
Project Manager



